
West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

1) The number of businesses who were victims of reported robberies for the periods of 1 January 2022 – 31 December 2022 and 

1 January 2023 and 31 December 2023 - 1894

2) The key search terms I am seeking in relation to the type of business are; convenience store, corner shop, grocery store, supermarket, 

newsagent, symbol group, tobacconist, off licence and independent retailer.

Please see below, these are the only types of business we record
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Not Recorded 54 63 60 61 64 39 43 45 66 56 51 41 643 86 62 74 77 63 62 72 51 57 77 63 59 803

Amusement Arcade 1 1

Bank / Building society 1 1

Bedsit 1 1

Betting Office 1 1 2

Building Site/Development 1 1

Bus 1 1

Cafe/Restaurant 1 1 2 1 1

Car Park 1 2 2 2 2 9 1 1 1 1 2 6

Chemist 2 2

Commercial premises 1 1 1 1 1 3

Doctor 's Surgery/Clinic 1 1

Driveway 1 1

Fast Food Outlet 1 1 1 1

Flat/Apartment 1 1 1 3

Football Ground 1 1

Hospital/Hospice 1 1

Hotel / B&B / Guest house 1 1 1 1

House- End Terrace 1 1

House- Semi Detached 1 1 1 2 1 4

Industrial Estate 1 1 1 1

2022 2023
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West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

Leisure Centre 1 1

Off Licence 1 1 2 1 1 2

Other 1 1

Outside 2 2 2 1 3 1 11 2 1 2 5 6 5 2 1 24

Petrol / Filling Station 1 2 1 5 1 1 1 2 2 3 2 21 2 2 3 7 1 3 1 1 3 23

Post/Sorting Office 2 2 1 1

Shop/Store/Supermarket 11 7 15 14 12 9 8 12 12 14 9 7 130 15 12 14 13 15 24 9 9 9 8 15 13 156

Shopping centre 1 1 1 1

Street / Road 2 1 2 1 1 1 8 2 1 1 4 3 2 13

Warehouse/Distribution 

Centre 1 1

Grand Total 70 75 78 82 86 53 57 65 84 77 68 51 846 104 80 93 92 85 91 98 70 78 92 85 80 1048

The key search terms I am seeking in relation to the weapon used are guns, knives, needles, unarmed and blunt weapons

 (baseball bats, clubs, etc).
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Not Recorded 41 37 37 39 37 28 32 40 48 56 43 33 471 68 45 57 62 49 56 55 46 48 56 47 44 633

Believed but not seen 3 3 6 5 5 2 3 2 1 1 31 8 3 6 4 5 3 8 1 4 5 3 5 55

Carried but not used 1 5 4 2 2 4 3 3 1 3 1 29 4 3 1 1 3 5 3 4 3 3 4 34

Other use 1 2 1 2 3 2 11 1 3 1 1 1 2 1 10

Used as a blunt instrument 1 1 2 1 5 1 1 3 1 6

Used as a threat 16 23 35 24 36 18 12 15 18 19 15 10 241 21 20 23 17 20 24 21 17 14 18 24 20 239

Used causing injury 4 2 4 2 3 1 3 1 2 3 25 2 2 5 4 2 4 2 1 4 5 2 2 35

Used causing no injury or 

damage 4 2 1 4 1 3 1 4 1 21 1 5 2 3 3 2 1 2 4 3 26

Used causing property 

damage only 3 2 1 3 2 1 12 2 1 3 2 1 1 10

Grand Total 70 75 78 82 86 53 57 65 84 77 68 51 846 104 80 93 92 85 91 98 70 78 92 85 80 1048
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West Midlands Police Freedom of Information
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Not Recorded 41 37 37 39 37 28 32 40 48 56 43 33 471 68 45 57 62 49 56 55 46 48 56 47 44 633

Acid / Corrosive Substance 1 1 1 1

Axe 2 1 1 1 2 1 8 1 1 2

Ball Bearing Gun 1 1

Baseball Bat 2 1 1 1 1 1 7 2 3 1 6

Blunt Instrument 1 1 2 1 2 1 8 1 1 1 1 2 6

Brick / Stone 1 1 1 1 4 1 2 3

Broken Bottle or Glass 1 1 1 3 1 1

Combat Knife 1 1 1 3 1 2 3

Cosh / Baton / Stick 2 1 1 4 1 1 1 1 1 5

Craft Knife 1 1 1 3 1 1 1 1 1 1 6

Dagger 1 1 1 1

Dog 1 1 1 1 1 1 4

Drugs / Noxious Substance 1 1 1 1

Explosive Device 1 1

Firearm - Other 1 3 1 5 1 1 1 2 5

Flick Knife 1 1 1 1 1 1 6 1 1 2 1 2 2 1 10

Hammer 3 2 2 2 3 2 4 1 2 21 3 2 2 1 3 1 2 1 4 1 20

Handgun - Air Pistol 1 1

Handgun - Imitation 1 1 1 1

Handgun - Other 4 4

Handgun - Unknown 1 2 4 1 5 2 1 1 1 18 1 1 1 1 4

Iron Bar 3 3 3 2 2 1 1 2 17 1 1 2 1 2 2 2 1 12

Kitchen Knife 4 6 10 5 8 3 4 2 3 5 3 2 55 2 4 4 1 5 3 11 4 3 5 6 2 50

Knife - Unknown 7 7 8 8 10 7 2 6 8 2 8 2 75 12 8 11 11 9 10 6 3 3 10 7 8 98
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West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

Knuckle Duster 1 1 1 1

Lock Knife 1 1 1 2 5 1 1 1 3

Machete 2 4 1 2 4 4 3 1 21 3 5 1 1 1 1 2 2 1 7 24

Meat Cleaver 1 1 2 1 5 2 2 4

Other Imitation Firearm 1 1 1 1

Other Weapon 3 3 2 5 4 5 2 6 1 2 1 34 4 5 1 3 3 6 10 1 3 2 2 2 42

Pen Knife 1 1 1 1 4 1 2 1 2 1 1 1 9

Pepper Spray 1 1

Razor Blade 2 2 1 1 2

Rifle - Other 1 1

Scissors 1 1 1 1 4 1 1 1 1 1 5

Screwdriver 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 8 1 1 1 1 1 3 3 11

Sharp Instrument 1 1 2 5 3 3 2 1 1 19 4 2 2 1 1 5 2 1 6 2 3 3 32

Shotgun - Sawn Off 1 1

Supposed Firearm - Type 

Unknown 2 1 1 1 1 1 7

Sword 1 1 2

Unbroken Bottle or Glass 1 1 2 4 1 1 1 1 1 4 17 3 4 2 4 5 3 3 2 1 1 1 29

Vehicle 1 1 1 1

Zombie Knife 1 1 1 1 4

Grand Total 70 75 78 82 86 53 57 65 84 77 68 51 846 104 80 93 92 85 91 98 70 78 92 85 80 1048

3) Could you also provide the name the businesses traded under and their address.

In relation to the trading name of the business we cannot locate this information except within the location address 

and it isn’t always recorded. 

4) Whether the robber was arrested and their conviction/sentence.

Ideally, I would like these figures broken down month-on-month.

Please see crimes by outcome below, we do not hold conviction / sentence data
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Not Recorded 1 1 2 1 1 1 3 7 3 1 4 19 13 13 66

Caution – Adult (Inc 

Conditional Caution) 1 1

Charge or Summons 16 20 26 10 16 12 9 12 17 19 14 8 179 27 20 21 26 20 27 27 8 5 21 18 20 240

Community Resolution 3 1 1 2 1 3 1 12 1 1 1 2 1 1 2 1 1 11

Diversionary, educational 

or intervention activity, 

resulting from the crime 

report, has been 

undertaken and it is not in 

the public interest to take 

any further action 2 1 1 4

Evidential Difficulties - 

Victim Based - Named 

suspect not identified 7 6 8 4 8 6 6 6 8 6 4 4 73 8 8 14 11 10 13 9 9 8 11 12 8 121

Investigation Complete: No 

suspect identified 37 34 36 49 39 26 33 37 46 47 44 32 460 56 40 49 45 41 33 43 43 46 37 36 31 500

Named Suspect identified: 

evidential difficulties 

prevent further action(no 

victim support) 1 2 4 7 5 3 2 6 7 1 3 4 45 6 5 3 2 5 3 6 4 7 3 1 3 48

Named Suspect identified: 

evidential difficulties 

prevent further 

action(victim support) 6 9 2 9 12 5 2 3 5 4 3 3 63 6 6 3 5 4 6 8 3 6 1 4 4 56

Taken into consideration 

(TIC) 2 3 4 2 1 12

The Offender has Died (all 

offences) 1 1

Grand Total 70 75 78 82 86 53 57 65 84 77 68 51 846 104 80 93 92 85 91 98 70 78 92 85 80 1048

Arrest Made
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West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

Years

Date 

Record 

Created No Yes

Grand 

Total

2022 Jan 55 15 70

Feb 47 28 75

Mar 47 31 78

Apr 66 16 82

May 58 28 86

Jun 39 14 53

Jul 45 12 57

Aug 53 12 65

Sep 60 24 84

Oct 59 18 77

Nov 51 17 68

Dec 40 11 51

2022 Total 620 226 846

2023 Jan 70 34 104

Feb 53 27 80

Mar 65 28 93

Apr 65 27 92

May 64 21 85

Jun 57 34 91

Jul 63 35 98

Aug 55 15 70

Sep 61 17 78

Oct 58 34 92

Nov 54 31 85

Dec 55 25 80

2023 Total 720 328 1048

Grand Total 1340 554 1894
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