West Midlands Police Freedom of Information
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I'd like to request information regarding fines on
Motorways under your jurisdiction

The total number of SP50 notices issued between the years 2018-2024. Information to be
provided by year i.e. 2018=x, 2019=y etc

Data older than 3 years will be unreliable due to the weeding parameters on our
systems. Data for 2021, 2022, 2023 and 2024 has been provided below:

Year Number of SP50 Notices Issued
2021 9241
2022 6194
2023 5212
2024 (to date) | 1278

The top ten 'sites' (or junctions) as recorded by the automatic cameras (e.g. 5925A), which
have recorded the most 'offences’ over the period 2018-2024. Information to be provided by
year i.e. 2018: site <reference>=<number of offences registered>, site
<reference>=<number of offences registered> etc. 2019: site <reference>=<number of
offences registered>, site <reference>=<number of offences registered> etc.

Location data provided as we record it, not as site reference data.

Year | Location Number of
Offences
2021 | M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 3A & 4 (NB) 289
M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 4 & 5 (NB) 356
M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 6 & 7 205
M42 (SB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 6 30
M6 (NB - ATM) between junctions 4 & 5 (NB) 147
M6 (NB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 8( NB) 4355
M6 (SB - ATM) between M54 exit slip & Junction 648
10 (SB)
M6 (SB-ATM) between junctions 5 and 4 (SB) 3210
M6 (SB-ATM) between junctions 10a and 10 (SB) 1
2022 | M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 3A & 4(NB) 790
M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 4 & 5(NB) 550
M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 6 & 7 267
M42 (SB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 6 1003
M6 (NB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 8(NB) 1350
M6 (SB - ATM) between M54 exit slip & Junction 2207
10 (SB)
M6 (SB-ATM) between junctions 5 and 4 (SB) 31
2023 | M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 3A & 4(NB) 73
M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 4 & 5(NB 33
M42 (NB - ATM) between junctions 6 & 7 42
M42 (SB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 6 517
M6 (NB - ATM) between junctions 4 & 5(NB) 73
M6 (NB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 8(NB) 1934
M6 (SB - ATM) between M54 exit slip & Junction 2540
10 (SB)
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(to M42 (SB - ATM) between junctions 4 & 3a

date)
M6 (NB - ATM) between junctions 7 & 8(NB) 275
M6 (SB - ATM) between M54 exit slip & Junction 996
10 (SB)

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I'd like to request information regarding traffic volume
on the stretch of M6 under your jurisdiction.

1. The annual volume of traffic (estimated if exact figures are not held) for years 2018-2024.
Information to be provided by year i.e. 2018=x, 2019=y etc

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I'd like to request information regarding emissions on
the stretch of M6 under your jurisdiction.

1. The total Emissions produced by motor vehicles within the M6 low emission zone before
and after zone was enforced. Providing at least three years prior, and all subsequent years.
Information to be provided by year i.e. 2018=x, 2019=y etc

This information is not held by West Midlands Police, you would need to contact the
National Highways Agency for this information: Disclosure Log - Highways England

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I'd like to request information regarding the variable
speed limit zones on the stretch of M6 under your jurisdiction.

The total number of SP50 notices issued before variable speed limit was enforced
and total number of SP50 notices issued since. Providing at least three years prior, and all
subsequent years. Information to be provided by year i.e. 2018=x, 2019=y etc

This information would have been completed manually and not by cameras, due to
the way the system weeds information the data is unreliable.

2. The total number of motoring accidents before variable speed limit was enforced, and total
number motoring accidents since. Providing at least three years prior, and all subsequent
years. Information to be provided by year i.e. 2018=x, 2019=y etc

3. The algorithm used to determine speed restrictions within the variable speed limit zone(s).
4. Changes to the variable speed limit algorithm by year, covering the period 2018-2024.
Information to be provided by year with description of change.

This information is not held by West Midlands Police, you would need to contact the
National Highways Agency for this information: Disclosure Log - Highways England
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https://foiform.highwaysengland.co.uk/
https://foiform.highwaysengland.co.uk/

