
West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

The number of times the offence of an ‘out of control dog causing injury’ (008/21) has been recorded.

Year Number

2018 659

2019 730

2020 703

2021 947

2022 1095

2023 1109

Total 5243

Please provide the data from Q1 split by victim demographics, including, but not limited to:

a)      Age

b)      Gender

c)      Ethnicity

d)      Relationship between victim and suspect (data not available)

Age 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 2023 Total

0 7 2 4 4 8 8 33

1 4 9 9 12 8 8 50

2 9 17 10 16 13 16 81

3 8 22 7 22 20 27 106

4 9 12 17 13 14 25 90

5 10 17 15 13 17 17 89

6 14 13 8 15 20 19 89

7 13 8 12 12 18 20 83

8 16 14 8 8 17 14 77

9 10 12 7 18 19 25 91

10 7 6 12 18 18 25 86

11 12 13 14 8 21 17 85

12 12 15 16 15 21 23 102
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13 10 16 11 13 19 22 91

14 2 10 12 13 16 17 70

15 5 17 5 12 12 21 72

16 7 8 3 12 13 18 61

17 8 3 7 17 13 12 60

18 7 6 6 11 11 12 53

19 11 8 10 5 8 13 55

20 7 12 12 9 9 14 63

21 6 9 16 16 10 7 64

22 17 7 12 17 16 13 82

23 5 12 14 11 16 12 70

24 11 7 12 10 19 16 75

25 11 14 9 11 29 14 88

26 10 15 11 10 21 17 84

27 12 5 13 14 18 15 77

28 12 10 11 14 19 23 89

29 9 14 5 14 13 16 71

30 18 4 12 19 20 20 93

31 7 14 8 12 16 15 72

32 10 12 14 15 18 12 81

33 8 8 15 16 14 21 82

34 10 14 15 14 12 20 85

35 6 10 5 19 20 23 83

36 6 13 13 13 26 21 92

37 6 10 10 19 23 9 77

38 13 13 9 20 14 20 89

39 10 11 17 16 23 18 95

40 11 12 11 16 10 18 78

41 9 5 9 25 20 13 81

42 7 13 15 15 27 14 91

43 7 3 10 18 18 14 70

44 9 9 5 18 12 16 69

45 8 11 16 13 16 10 74
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46 6 7 6 15 12 13 59

47 9 8 9 11 10 10 57

48 10 11 6 15 18 17 77

49 11 11 11 12 17 10 72

50 10 8 10 15 17 16 76

51 6 11 8 16 20 12 73

52 3 14 14 10 10 13 64

53 13 13 5 17 17 18 83

54 9 9 16 15 13 15 77

55 12 8 8 12 14 18 72

56 11 11 10 16 13 17 78

57 7 10 7 10 12 13 59

58 11 11 6 5 5 5 43

59 6 7 7 11 10 3 44

60 3 5 6 12 7 14 47

61 5 9 9 8 8 10 49

62 6 8 8 5 17 6 50

63 6 5 5 10 7 9 42

64 5 8 2 5 5 8 33

65 7 4 4 7 8 9 39

66 4 0 2 3 9 8 26

67 5 5 1 6 9 13 39

68 9 7 4 6 5 10 41

69 9 5 5 4 10 5 38

70 3 5 3 5 7 4 27

71 4 1 6 3 7 7 28

72 9 4 3 3 1 7 27

73 3 6 6 4 4 3 26

74 3 3 1 3 6 4 20

75 2 5 2 5 5 2 21

76 1 1 3 3 2 6 16

77 5 2 4 1 5 5 22

78 2 2 1 3 4 7 19
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79 1 2 1 1 2 2 9

80 0 2 0 1 2 6 11

81 1 0 1 3 2 2 9

82 0 1 1 0 1 0 3

83 0 1 1 1 1 1 5

84 0 1 2 1 0 1 5

85 0 1 1 3 1 1 7

86 0 0 1 1 0 3 5

87 1 0 0 0 0 2 3

88 0 0 0 0 2 1 3

89 1 0 0 0 0 1 2

Not known/not recorded 14 3 5 9 5 2 38

Total 659 730 703 947 1095 1109 5243

Gender 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 2023 Total

Female 314 180 152 371 503 495 2015

Male 343 235 204 440 564 593 2379

Unknown 2 5 3 2 2 6 20

Indeterminate 0 1 0 1 0 0 2

Not known/not recorded 0 309 344 133 26 15 827

Total 659 730 703 947 1095 1109 5243

Ethnicity 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 2023 Total

Afro - Carribean 0 4 10 14 14 11 53
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Arabic Or North African 0 4 0 3 2 2 11

Asian 48 22 17 32 41 29 189

Black 38 15 4 8 5 11 81

Chinese, Japanese, Or 

Any Other South East 

Asian 3 0 1 1 1 0 6

Dark European 0 2 1 1 2 4 10

White - North European 477 124 35 80 93 70 879

White - South European 8 1 1 1 3 1 15

White Skinned 

European 0 87 125 114 135 135 596

Other 10 4 1 0 3 1 19

Not Known/Unknown 75 467 508 693 796 845 3384

Total 659 730 703 947 1095 1109 5243

The data from Q1 split by outcome

Outcome Description 2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 2023 Total

Caution - Adult 8 0 0 0 0 0 8

Caution – Adult (Inc 

Conditional Caution) 0 8 13 15 11 8 55

Charge 3 0 0 0 0 0 3

Charge or Summons 0 18 11 4 4 3 40
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Community Resolution 99 126 140 129 144 89 727

Evidential Difficulties - 

Victim Based - Named 

suspect not identified 0 20 6 10 21 7 64

Filed, no Susp, no 

further enq 283 62 0 0 0 0 345

Formal action against 

the offender is not in 

the public interest 

(Police) 0 10 3 4 2 0 19

Further action will be 

taken by another body 0 1 5 3 8 2 19

Further non-Police 

Action 2 1 0 0 0 0 3

Investigation Complete: 

No suspect identified 0 237 240 345 276 327 1425

Named Suspect 

identified: evidential 

difficulties prevent 

further action(no victim 

support) 0 136 245 409 570 463 1823

Named Suspect 

identified: evidential 

difficulties prevent 

further action(victim 

support) 0 43 26 24 45 23 161

Offender Died 1 0 0 0 0 0 1

Postal Charge 25 5 0 0 0 0 30

Susp ID: No Victim 

Support 142 31 0 0 0 0 173
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Susp ID: Not in public 

interest 3 2 0 0 0 0 5

Susp ID: Oth Evidential 

Difficulty 13 1 0 0 0 0 14

Suspect Identified, but 

not in the public interest 

for police to investigate 0 9 5 1 1 0 16

The Offender has Died 

(all offences) 0 1 1 1 0 0 3

Not Known/Not 

recorded 80 19 8 2 13 187 309

Total 659 730 703 947 1095 1109 5243
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