
West Midlands Police      Freedom of Information 

14/08/23  Ref:     1193A/23 

REQUEST  
  
1.The total number of reports received of theft from an individual at 
Birmingham airport broken down by location and year in 2019, 2020 2021, 2022 
and 2023. 
 
2019 = 11 

2020 = 3 

2021 = 2 

2022 = 25 

2023 = 7 (up to 08/08/2023 

Total reports received of theft from individual = 38 

2.The total number of reports received of theft from an individual that took 
place on an airplane that landed or took off from Birmingham airport and fell 
under the West Midlands Police Service’s jurisdiction, broken down by location 
and year in 2019, 2020 2021, 2022, and 2023. 
 
0 
  
3.Where the thefts took place at Birmingham airport, the total value of goods 
stolen from an individual broken down by location and year in 2019, 2020 2021, 
2022 and 2023.  
 

Year Location Value 

2019 Arrivals Terminal £250 

2019 Check in Desk £250 

2019 Departures Landside £250 

2019 Unknown / Not recorded 
Unknown / Not 

recorded 

2019 Arrivals Terminal £95 

2019 Unknown / Not recorded £150 

2019 Arrivals Terminal £250 

2019 Landside Terminal £250 

2019 Check in Desk £215 

2019 Departures Landside £100 

2019 Departures Landside £300 

2020 Airport Way £80 

2020 Airport Way £250 
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2020 Arrivals Terminal £95 

2021 Airport Way £100 

2021 Arrivals Terminal £655 

2022  Unknown / Not recorded  £100 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £500 

2022 Departures Landside £50 

2022 Landside Terminal £150 

2022  Unknown / Not recorded £700 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £2,000 

2022 Departures Airside £300 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £250 

2022 Check in Desk £80 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £600 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £200 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £100 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £1,000 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £4,000 

2022 Arrivals Terminal £150 

2023 Arrivals Terminal £100 

2023 Arrivals Terminal £50 

2023 Central Search £200 

2023 Central Search £350 

2023 Central Search £100 

2023 Trident Road £400 

2023 Arrivals Terminal £1,000 
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4.Where the thefts took place on a plane that took off or landed at Birmingham 
airport and fell under the West Midlands Police Service’s jurisdiction, the total 
value of goods stolen, broken down by location and year in 2019, 2020 2021, 
2022 and 2023.  
 
0 
    
5.The total number of individuals charged for theft from a person at 
Birmingham airport broken down by location and year in 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 
and 2023.  
 
0 
    
6.The total number of individuals charged for theft from a person that took 
place on a plane that took off or landed at Birmingham airport and fell under 
the West Midlands Police Service’s jurisdiction, broken down by location and 
year in 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022 and 2023.  
 
0 
 

 
 

 


