West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

REQUEST

| am requesting details of all used police vehicles sold by West Midlands Police
over the past five years. The details | would like are as follows:

1. Vehicle registration number - This information is exempt by virtue of
Section 40 — Personal Data

2. Vehicle model — Please see table below.

3. The date of sale - Please see table below.

4. The mileage of the vehicle at the time of sale - Please see table below.

5. The date of the vehicle's last MOT prior to sale

We do not record this, this is because WMP Fleet have an exemption from
Department for Transport due to our service regime. Therefore, under FOI there is no
recorded information held.

6. The price at which the vehicle was sold - Please see table below.

7. Whether the sale was made privately, through an auction, or trade

All WMP vehicles are sold via Auction Houses.

DATE OF SALE MODEL MILEAGE SOLD

PRICE
Apr-18 OCTAVIA 105800 3523.33
Apr-18 CORSA 59296 2356.67
Apr-18 CORSA 67089 2356.67
Apr-18 FABIA 49498 2523.33
Apr-18 MONDEO 49050 4106.67
Apr-18 DAILY 84412 3640.00
Apr-18 DAILY 95257 3940.00
Apr-18 INSIGNIA 121197 1690.00
Apr-18 EXPERT 107995 3040.00
May-18 TRANSPORTER 41420 4440.00
May-18 DAILY 90331 4290.00
May-18 DAILY 90501 4740.00
May-18 TRANSIT 28109 2825.00
May-18 LAGUNA 27961 229.17
May-18 GOLF 56608 4375.00
May-18 XF 73937 8041.67
May-18 INSIGNIA 81390 1458.33
May-18 INSIGNIA 82561 1416.67
May-18 RANGER 71051 6575.00
May-18 EXPERT 113735 2275.00
May-18 Al 75544 4458.33
May-18 3 SERIES 84919 2375.00
Jun-18 A3 68264 3666.67
Jun-18 ASTRA 60202 916.67
Jun-18 ASTRA 68537 1666.67
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Jun-18 CORSA 77821 1291.67
Jun-18 CORSA 103368 1166.67
Jun-18 CORSA 94243 1416.67
Jun-18 DAILY 83020 3300.00
Jun-18 DAILY 87237 3800.00
Jun-18 INSIGNIA 107726 1458.33
Jun-18 3 SERIES 67967 3833.33
Jun-18 3 SERIES 107812 5500.00
Jun-18 3 SERIES 121328 5083.33
Jun-18 3 SERIES 126553 5583.33
Jul-18 OCTAVIA 22043 6083.33
Jul-18 S5 74692 12600.00
Jul-18 MINI COOPER 67686 4541.67
Jul-18 1 SERIES 77982 6166.67
Jul-18 CORSA 95373 1166.67
Jul-18 INSIGNIA 101637 3000.00
Jul-18 INSIGNIA 100620 3000.00
Jul-18 INSIGNIA 101637 3083.33
Jul-18 EXPERT 86291 2800.00
Jul-18 PARTNER 41750 4750.00
Aug-18 CORSA 81044 1523.33
Aug-18 ZAFIRA 98542 1606.66
Aug-18 INSIGNIA 97315 1023.33
Aug-18 FABIA 36872 2606.67
Aug-18 CORSA 85604 1398.33
Aug-18 CORSA 85646 1440.00
Aug-18 CORSA 64596 1773.33
Aug-18 CORSA 98444 1231.67
Aug-18 CORSA 79270 1398.33
Aug-18 FOCUS 85798 1440.00
Aug-18 DAILY 70882 2140.00
Aug-18 INSIGNIA 90582 3148.33
Aug-18 3 SERIES 36696 7023.33
Aug-18 TRANSIT 56386 1390.00
Aug-18 PASSAT 74884 606.67

Aug-18 DAILY 71570 2840.00
Aug-18 INSIGNIA 103330 3106.67
Aug-18 INSIGNIA 105081 3106.67
Sep-18 VIVARO 46387 3784.02
Sep-18 CORSA 54905 1796.62
Sep-18 INSIGNIA 90703 1712.04
Sep-18 AURIS 71114 1458.29
Sep-18 INSIGNIA 112148 2853.91
Sep-18 INSIGNIA 109128 2980.79
Sep-18 INSIGNIA 103993 2896.21
Sep-18 EXPERT 145032 2159.47
Sep-18 EXPERT 134175 2244.05
Sep-18 EXPERT 133987 2455.52
Sep-18 FOCUS 90599 300.00

Sep-18 C MAX 116713 200.00

Sep-18 TRANSIT 137460 1850.00
Sep-18 CORSA 66739 1583.33
Sep-18 CORSA 61443 1666.67
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Sep-18 CORSA 61840 1666.67
Sep-18 CORSA 63947 1750.00
Sep-18 CORSA 75974 1583.33
Sep-18 INSIGNIA 98530 2750.00
Sep-18 PARTNER 27300 3000.00
Oct-18 EXPERT 136227 1510.00
Oct-18 EXPERT 65775 3060.00
Oct-18 EXPERT 50166 3810.00
Oct-18 CORSA 62530 1393.33
Oct-18 CORSA 63505 1643.33
Oct-18 CORSA 62886 1727.67
Oct-18 CORSA 60464 1351.67
Oct-18 CORSA 67904 1351.67
Oct-18 CORSA 67936 1726.67
Oct-18 DAILY 84164 3150.00
Oct-18 OCTAVIA 60953 2523.33
Oct-18 EXPERT 69013 2250.00
Oct-18 CORSA 69926 1416.67
Oct-18 CORSA 61763 1125.00
Oct-18 CORSA 87215 1208.33
Oct-18 CORSA 65903 1541.67
Oct-18 CORSA 63484 1250.00
Oct-18 CORSA 67910 1458.33
Oct-18 CORSA 70884 1416.67
Oct-18 CORSA 71559 1458.33
Oct-18 CORSA 65547 1375.00
Oct-18 DAILY 90099 2990.00
Oct-18 DAILY 87877 2440.00
Oct-18 INSIGNIA 113445 1148.33
Oct-18 INSIGNIA 101583 1023.33
Oct-18 S1000 41601 2690.00
Nov-18 S MAX 81598 1500.00
Nov-18 EXPERT 67952 4400.00
Nov-18 EXPERT 74960 3600.00
Nov-18 6 63481 1375.00
Nov-18 A3 47689 6500.00
Nov-18 FOCUS 78327 3250.00
Nov-18 CORSA 66032 1750.00
Nov-18 CORSA 64735 1791.67
Nov-18 CORSA 64350 1958.33
Nov-18 CORSA 66332 1875.00
Nov-18 VIVARO 42145 5255.00
Nov-18 EXPERT 73643 3205.00
Nov-18 EXPERT 48829 4105.00
Nov-18 EXPERT 54217 3655.00
Nov-18 EXPERT 68239 3605.00
Nov-18 INSIGNIA 110869 1180.00
Nov-18 CORSA 86461 1263.33
Nov-18 INSIGNIA 123763 2138.33
Nov-18 ASTRA 228235 105.00
Nov-18 5 SERIES 73048 5305.00
Nov-18 DAILY 109264 2905.00
Dec-18 EXPERT 57061 3400.00
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Dec-18 INSIGNIA 79802 1416.67
Dec-18 ASTRA 67920 2250.00
Dec-18 CORSA 62239 1750.00
Dec-18 INSIGNIA 103452 2291.67
Dec-18 INSIGNIA 108961 2541.67
Dec-18 INSIGNIA 111436 2125.00
Dec-18 INSIGNIA 97192 2708.33
Dec-18 INSIGNIA 97332 2666.67
Jan-19 DAILY 21455 7956.16
Jan-19 TRANSIT 44512 2843.03
Jan-19 MONDEO 86576 2875.53
Jan-19 INSIGNIA 50558 2748.67
Jan-19 CORSA 61857 1860.53
Jan-19 DAILY 79932 4554.28
Jan-19 INSIGNIA 116220 2410.33
Jan-19 BIPPER 33593 2640.53
Jan-19 A4 145426 5709.08
Jan-19 OCTAVIA 81657 3666.67
Jan-19 3 SERIES 1819 18333.33
Jan-19 GOLF 86245 3500.00
Jan-19 A3 NOT RECORDED 7666.67
Jan-19 208 58875 4083.33
Jan-19 S MAX 58222 8500.00
Jan-19 A CLASS 59807 10083.33
Jan-19 GOLF 73843 7583.33
Jan-19 EXPERT 76515 3551.78
Mar-19 CORSA 97237 1437.62
Mar-19 INSIGNIA 69496 3087.00
Mar-19 MONDEO 65995 3171.58
Mar-19 ASTRA 48182 1310.75
Mar-19 ASTRA 86000 760.95

Mar-19 CORSA 58779 1437.62
Mar-19 CORSA 95475 1564.50
Mar-19 CORSA 59251 1733.67
Mar-19 CORSA 55045 1987.42
Mar-19 INSIGNIA 103355 2579.50
Mar-19 CORSA 70710 1606.78
Jul-20 CORSA 69328 810.00

Jul-20 EXPERT 9418 2666.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 123749 2950.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 130492 2996.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 94418 2500.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 116618 2600.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 116544 2890.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 100410 3105.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 112860 3178.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 94418 2900.00
Jul-20 EXPERT 122304 3355.00
Aug-20 ZAFIRA 112786 971.67

Aug-20 ZAFIRA 97187 1721.67
Aug-20 1 SERIES 61945 6471.67
Aug-20 OCTAVIA 50907 6971.67
Aug-20 INSIGNIA 45294 3471.67

07/06/23 Ref:  786A/23



West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

Aug-20 S3 94418 9471.67
Aug-20 POLO 94418 4138.33
Aug-20 POLO 56514 5805.00
Aug-20 CORSA 94418 888.33
Aug-20 CORSA 64279 1305.00
Aug-20 ASTRA 95934 1305.00
Aug-20 CORSA 84211 971.67
Aug-20 CORSA 53745 2055.00
Aug-20 EXPERT 129280 1455.00
Aug-20 EXPERT 113577 1950.00
Aug-20 EXPERT 147766 1700.00
Aug-20 EXPERT 162485 1750.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 120073 2150.00
Sep-20 NAVARA 120817 7050.00
Sep-20 CORSA 96904 657.50
Sep-20 3 SERIES 15517 9333.33
Sep-20 3 SERIES 11289 11041.67
Sep-20 INSIGNIA 127631 212.50
Sep-20 EXPERT 106481 1950.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 96386 2350.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 118910 2159.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 122610 1920.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 122394 2250.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 108873 2450.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 106946 2410.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 146132 1400.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 155833 1022.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 87246 3900.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 146132 2440.00
Sep-20 EXPERT 111547 2450.00
Sep-20 CORSA 70669 1305.00
Oct-20 X3 85407 8005.83
Oct-20 CORSA 86263 625.00
Oct-20 VITO 59715 6050.00
Oct-20 DAILY 100639 3750.00
Oct-20 INSIGNIA 104625 1416.67
Oct-20 INSIGNIA 100162 1583.33
Oct-20 DISCOVERY 70076 3295.83
Oct-20 DISCOVERY 88155 6183.33
Nov-20 CORSA 64172 1123.33
Nov-20 CORSA 49458 1123.33
Nov-20 CORSA 73018 1040.00
Nov-20 CORSA 67143 1123.33
Nov-20 CORSA 59489 1206.67
Nov-20 CORSA 67305 1040.00
Nov-20 CORSA 72592 873.33
Nov-20 CORSA 84744 873.33
Nov-20 CORSA 87507 956.67
Nov-20 CORSA 67167 1456.67
Nov-20 SQ5 86245 11666.67
Nov-20 CORSA 82608 1208.33
Nov-20 CORSA 71052 1166.67
Nov-20 CORSA 75058 1000.00
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Nov-20 CORSA 65511 1500.00
Nov-20 CORSA 82914 2541.67
Nov-20 CORSA 77576 2750.00
Nov-20 CORSA 70163 2500.00
Nov-20 CORSA 66455 1416.67
Nov-20 DISCOVERY 81474 8833.33
Dec-20 DAILY 89071 3737.00
Dec-20 X5 144112 6970.00
Dec-20 X5 130976 5753.33
Dec-20 CORSA 100002 625.00
Dec-20 DAILY 84968 4000.00
Dec-20 DAILY 104579 3651.00
Dec-20 INSIGNIA 103147 1266.67
Dec-20 INSIGNIA 143390 1285.83
Dec-20 X5 172011 6917.50
Mar-21 CORSA 101081 445.83
Mar-21 CORSA 93232 545.00
Mar-21 CORSA 101081 416.67
Mar-21 CORSA 84922 541.67
Mar-21 CORSA 104624 475.00
Mar-21 CORSA 103016 395.83
Mar-21 DAILY 89798 4010.00
Mar-21 DAILY 74998 2750.00
Mar-21 DAILY 83030 2950.00
Mar-21 308 121365 141.67
Mar-21 CORSA 98890 458.33
Mar-21 CORSA 93480 541.67
Mar-21 CORSA 101607 166.67
Mar-21 CORSA 95986 416.67
Mar-21 CORSA 81785 655.83
Mar-21 CORSA 88712 583.33
Mar-21 CORSA 84776 708.33
Mar-21 CORSA 90051 666.67
Mar-21 CORSA 93555 750.00
Mar-21 CORSA 99163 1208.33
Mar-21 CORSA 107802 192.50
Mar-21 CORSA 106616 292.50
Mar-21 CORSA 81166 382.50
Mar-21 CORSA 89523 395.83
Mar-21 HI LUX 74669 8008.00
Mar-21 INSIGNIA 132003 1166.67
Mar-21 INSIGNIA 121880 1416.67
Mar-21 INSIGNIA 148487 1500.00
Mar-21 INSIGNIA 134790 1116.67
Apr-21 TRANSIT 63341 2690.00
Apr-21 SUPERB 39723 8476.67
Apr-21 SUPERB 50183 7790.00
Apr-21 PASSAT 87265 2706.67
Apr-21 SUPERB 30685 8373.33
Apr-21 SUPERB 69032 7956.67
Apr-21 SCIROCCO 85279 8623.33
Apr-21 CITAN 41553 5190.00
Apr-21 308 44478 7290.00
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Apr-21 CORSA 71831 1123.33
Apr-21 FOCUS 46439 4040.00
Apr-21 FOCUS 56306 3706.67
Apr-21 CORSA 98463 458.33
Apr-21 CORSA 90446 625.00
Apr-21 CORSA 101195 270.83
Apr-21 CORSA 95263 437.50
Apr-21 CORSA 129396 437.50
Apr-21 CORSA 91310 833.33
Apr-21 CORSA 87663 708.33
Apr-21 CORSA 94703 625.00
Apr-21 CORSA 88551 471.67
Apr-21 CORSA 78472 899.17
Apr-21 CORSA 116118 395.83
Apr-21 CORSA 112019 416.67
Apr-21 3 SERIES 87723 2083.33
May-21 CORSA 102800 791.67
May-21 CORSA 112038 185.00
May-21 CORSA 97584 875.00
May-21 DAILY 82138 4090.00
May-21 DAILY 92235 3749.00
May-21 INSIGNIA 118474 582.50
May-21 INSIGNIA 141648 391.67
May-21 EXPERT 84922 4025.00
May-21 EXPERT 94838 3355.00
Aug-21 CORSA 45092 1875.00
Nov-21 MAXUS 27404 3700.00
Nov-21 CORSA 83617 1562.50
Nov-21 Q3 93800 8900.00
Nov-21 LEON 62389 9700.00
Nov-21 EXPERT 80006 5022.00
Nov-21 BOXER 83355 5240.00
Nov-21 OCTAVIA 167572 3573.33
Nov-21 OCTAVIA 145546 4406.67
Nov-21 MASTER 27483 4640.00
Nov-21 EXPERT 43157 5640.00
Nov-21 SUPERB NOT RECORDED 4823.33
Nov-21 VITO 54770 10640.00
Nov-21 LEON 80794 4240.00
Nov-21 A CLASS 46225 9990.00
Nov-21 INSIGNIA 100847 2291.67
Nov-21 INSIGNIA 138214 1708.33
Nov-21 INSIGNIA 140250 1500.00
Nov-21 INSIGNIA 116540 2125.00
Nov-21 INSIGNIA 132157 1073.33
Nov-21 EXPERT 72845 5025.00
Jan-22 INSIGNIA 76809 1950.00
Jan-22 ZAFIRA 44532 4150.00
Jan-22 GOLF 66672 11800.00
Jan-22 GSX 19576 4564.17
Feb-22 TRANSIT 44464 9710.00
Feb-22 CORSA 101518 1293.33
Feb-22 INSIGNIA 63591 3951.67
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Feb-22 INSIGNIA 53530 4201.67
Feb-22 FOCUS 32667 5868.33
Feb-22 CORSA 26886 4701.67
Feb-22 FOCUS 41001 5868.33
Feb-22 DAILY 76155 3301.00
Feb-22 DAILY 83265 2950.00
Feb-22 DAILY 48035 5000.00
Feb-22 INSIGNIA 126225 1126.67
Feb-22 DAILY 89900 3200.00
Feb-22 CORSA 28778 3785.00
Feb-22 NINJA 20399 4583.33
Feb-22 DAILY 66820 3855.00
Feb-22 INSIGNIA 66932 1376.67
Feb-22 BOXER 69278 5880.00
Feb-22 ZAFIRA 40759 4500.00
Feb-22 FOCUS 64124 650.00

Feb-22 CORSA 31333 5500.00
Feb-22 FOCUS 47009 7250.00
Feb-22 INSIGNIA 135217 1500.00
Mar-22 A7 39021 14933.33
Mar-22 E43 26526 21433.33
Apr-22 SPRINTER 43805 8605.00
Apr-22 BOXER 49987 5805.00
Apr-22 FOCUS 25038 4705.00
Apr-22 ASTRA 33637 2788.33
Apr-22 SUPERB 85279 4871.67
Apr-22 CORSA 91974 1205.00
Apr-22 CORSA 76539 1538.33
Apr-22 CORSA 24852 3538.33
Apr-22 EXPERT 107735 2105.00
Apr-22 PARTNER 23996 5305.00
Apr-22 308 43633 7000.00
Apr-22 DAILY 75712 3750.00
Apr-22 DAILY 80249 3450.00
Apr-22 TRANSPORTER 54334 8040.00
Apr-22 CORSA 59573 1600.00
Apr-22 CORSA 61660 1950.00
Apr-22 CORSA 57925 2300.00
Apr-22 ASTRA 26441 5000.00
Apr-22 308 41933 6800.00
Apr-22 308 41839 6200.00
Apr-22 A6 89637 10416.67
May-22 TRANSIT 33796 7840.00
May-22 CORSA 84259 1156.67
May-22 Al 78864 5323.33
May-22 V40 NOT RECORDED 6240.00
May-22 ASTRA NOT RECORDED 5656.67
May-22 CORSA 50233 1740.00
May-22 OCTAVIA 59375 7823.33
May-22 CORSA 66098 1156.67
May-22 CORSA 81263 906.67

May-22 A4 30649 5823.33
Jun-22 V40 63239 5740.00
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Jul-22 EXPERT 67693 4560.00
Jul-22 OCTAVIA 158007 2000.00
Jul-22 CORSA 106108 800.00

Jul-22 CORSA 110561 1600.00
Jul-22 INSIGNIA 144354 1700.00
Jul-22 INSIGNIA 145700 1700.00
Jul-22 INSIGNIA 120527 2100.00
Jul-22 INSIGNIA 66161 1300.00
Jul-22 INSIGNIA 66161 2600.00
Aug-22 X5 35289 4416.67
Aug-22 X5 69105 4583.33
Aug-22 DAILY 77949 4749.00
Aug-22 3 SERIES 143226 875.00

Aug-22 BOXER 24095 7560.00
Aug-22 INSIGNIA 13675 2499.17
Aug-22 3 SERIES 109349 750.00

Aug-22 3 SERIES 95724 2500.00
Aug-22 EXPERT 71851 6810.00
Aug-22 EXPERT 79881 6110.00
Aug-22 EXPERT 71196 6410.00
Aug-22 EXPERT 51334 5110.00
Aug-22 ASTRA 43939 3208.00
Aug-22 INSIGNIA 125865 960.00

Aug-22 BIPPER 54612 3110.00
Aug-22 BIPPER 70979 2310.00
Aug-22 INSIGNIA 109305 1543.33
Aug-22 3 SERIES 78818 1626.67
Aug-22 EXPERT 78078 7800.00
Aug-22 SHOGUN 79627 5200.00
Aug-22 INSIGNIA 95074 1600.00
Aug-22 INSIGNIA 111575 2700.00
Aug-22 3 SERIES 105209 2900.00
Aug-22 3 SERIES 74651 3150.00
Nov-22 OCTAVIA 74969 3700.00
Nov-22 EXPERT 59034 3960.00
Nov-22 CORSA 87439 1100.00
Nov-22 INSIGNIA 101467 2000.00
Nov-22 2 SERIES 41820 10850.00
Nov-22 CORSA 66494 1750.00
Nov-22 FOCUS 106058 1500.00
Nov-22 CORSA 55238 3950.00
Nov-22 INSIGNIA 122114 2000.00
Nov-22 INSIGNIA 113865 900.00

Nov-22 3 SERIES 119334 1933.33
Nov-22 3 SERIES 148295 3208.33
Nov-22 X5 102408 6766.67
Nov-22 X5 11573 6933.33
Nov-22 3 SERIES 119574 1164.17
Nov-22 3 SERIES 124749 2883.33
Nov-22 3 SERIES 158667 2516.67
Nov-22 5 SERIES 71442 2516.67
Nov-22 X5 147987 6100.00
Nov-22 3 SERIES 142017 2954.17
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Dec-22 CORSA 116165 417.50
Dec-22 CORSA 93575 636.67
Dec-22 CORSA 80495 896.67
Dec-22 XC40 62306 10685.00
Dec-22 CORSA 77727 1230.00
Dec-22 CORSA 81124 1230.00
Dec-22 FABIA 42346 3811.33
Dec-22 CORSA 48339 2563.33
Dec-22 INSIGNIA 124698 1646.67
Jan-23 CORSA 96595 543.33
Jan-23 CORSA 98145 1043.33
Jan-23 CORSA 95851 543.33
Jan-23 IS 53017 8460.00
Jan-23 OCTAVIA 57116 2743.33
Jan-23 INSIGNIA 89761 1076.67
Jan-23 3 SERIES 52989 5641.67
Jan-23 3 SERIES 94533 2377.50
Jan-23 3 SERIES 128760 2997.50
Jan-23 3 SERIES 97927 1312.50
Jan-23 5 SERIES 90169 2341.67
Jan-23 3 SERIES 79691 2627.50
Jan-23 CORSA 90578 626.67
Jan-23 ASTRA 37706 6293.33
Jan-23 BIPPER 34995 910.00
Mar-23 TRANSIT 45028 11730.00
Mar-23 CORSA 94758 521.67
Mar-23 CORSA 96759 730.00
Mar-23 CORSA 95067 813.33
Mar-23 CORSA 103794 730.00
Mar-23 INSIGNIA 15501 3146.67
Mar-23 RANGEROVER 34263 23396.67
Mar-23 F PACE 52294 16896.67
Mar-23 CORSA 83233 1563.33
Mar-23 INSIGNIA 119250 291.67
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