

1. **How many disability hate crimes have been recorded by your police force for the last two financial years – 2020/21 and 2021/22?**

Year	Number
2020-21	1,278
2021-22	630
Total	1,908

2. **How many disability hate crimes were committed by repeat offenders (of a previous disability hate crime) in the last two financial years- 2020/21 and 2021/22?**

Our data are not organised in such a way as to allow us to provide this information within the appropriate (cost) limit under the Freedom of Information (FOI) Act. Please see covering letter for further information.

3. **How many disability hate crimes during each financial year (2020/21 and 2021/22) concerned acts of violence against a person?**

Year	Number
2020-21	821
2021-22	394
Total	1,215

NB Where the offence group is listed as 'Violence against the person'

4. **How many incidents of disability hate crime were recorded as taking place online in each financial year (2020/21 and 2021/22)?**

Year	Number
2020-21	82
2021-22	143
Total	225

NB Where the 'Online crime' marker has been applied

5. **How many of the recorded disability hate crimes in each financial year (2020/21 and 2021/22) resulted in a CPS referral?**

Outcome Description	2020-21	2021-22	Total
Not recorded	15	27	42
Caution – Adult (Inc Conditional Caution)	2	1	3
Charge or Summons	43	6	49
Community Resolution	15	11	26
Evidential Difficulties - Victim Based - Named suspect not identified	21	35	56
Formal action against the offender is not in the public interest (Police)	5		5
Further action will be taken by another body	27	3	30
Investigation Complete: No suspect identified	343	199	542
Named Suspect identified: evidential difficulties prevent further action (no victim support)	507	165	672
Named Suspect identified: evidential difficulties prevent further action (victim support)	284	182	466
Postal Charge With Alternative Offence	2		2
Prosecution prevented – Named suspect identified but is too ill (physical or mental health) to prosecute	12		12
Prosecution time limit expired: Suspect identified but prosecution time limit has expired		1	1
The Offender has Died (all offences)	2		2
Total	1,278	630	1,908

6. How many of the recorded online disability hate crimes in each financial year (2020/21 and 2021/22) resulted in a CPS referral?

Outcome Description	2020-21	2021-22	Total
Not recorded	2	4	6
Caution – Adult (Inc Conditional Caution)	-	1	1
Community Resolution	2	6	8
Evidential Difficulties - Victim Based - Named suspect not identified	3	11	14
Further action will be taken by another body	2	-	2
Investigation Complete: No suspect identified	34	40	74
Named Suspect identified: evidential difficulties prevent further action (no victim support)	21	48	69
Named Suspect identified: evidential difficulties prevent further action (victim support)	18	33	51
Total	82	143	225