REQUEST

1. How many Youth Justice Services/Youth Offending Teams do you have across your force area?

1 per Neighbourhood Policing unit – therefore 8 in total.

2.How many officers Police Staff, PC, Sgt or Insp are seconded to each YJS/YOT?

No seconded officers.

3.In addition to this does your force make a financial contribution to each YJS/YOT in your force area?

Yes, Please see answer within Question 4.

4.If so how much has been paid by the force for the last three financial years (2019-2020; 2020-2021; and 2021-2022)?

The actual expenditure recorded against - Youth Offending Team is as below, however please note that the 21/22 Financial Year has not yet ended and there is more expenditure likely to be processed.

19/20	20/21	21/22
£182,400.00	£296,481.54	£172,108.77

The table below details the annual contribution made to each of the local authority area youth offending services in the West Midlands. The budget is set at £182,400 and this is based on the following contributions that are made.

Birmingham Children's Trust	£62,016.00
Coventry City Council	£20,064.00
Dudley Borough Council	£16,416.00
Sandwell Children's Trust	£21,888.00
Solihull Metropolitan Borough Council	£12,768.00
Walsall Council	£21,888.00
Wolverhampton City Council	£27,360.00
Total	£182,400.00

5.Is any financial contribution made by the OPCC in your force area?

This information is not held by WMP therefore under FOI there is no recorded information held. It might be that the OPCC has some relevant information contact details can be found

<u>Freedom of Information - West Midlands Police & Crime Commissioner</u> (westmidlands-pcc.gov.uk)

6.If so how much is paid by the OPCC for the last three financial years (2019-2020; 2020-2021; and 2021-2022)?

10/03/22 Ref: 234A/22

West Midlands Police

Freedom of Information

See answer to Question 5

10/03/22 Ref: 234A/22