West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

1) How many police officers have been assaulted at work each year in the years 2005,
2006, 2007, 2008, 2009, 2010, 2011, 2012, 2013, 2014, 2015, 2016, 2017, 2018, 2019,
2020

Please be advised that the below data has been provided by our Health and Safety
department. This means that the figures provided will generally be assaults that have
resulted in injury (which will be different to the number of assaults recorded on our crimes
database). In addition, we do not hold data prior to 2012.

Year No. of Assaults

2005
2006
2007
2008
2009
2010
2011
2012 370
2013 445
2014 490
2015 628
2016 849
2017 799
2018 844
2019 1,159
2020 1,138

2) How many police officers have required medical attention due to assaults against
them during the years 2005, 2006, 2007, 2008, 2009, 2010, 2011, 2012, 2013, 2014,
2015, 2016, 2017, 2018, 2019, 2020

Please be advised that the below data has been provided by our Health and Safety
department. This means that the figures provided will generally be assaults that have
resulted in injury (which will be different to the number of assaults recorded on our crimes
database). In addition, we do not hold data prior to 2012.

Year First Aid
2005
2006
2007
2008
2009

2010

Hospital
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2011
2012 63 95
2013 70 95
2014 75 101
2015 107 99
2016 126 122
2017 102 99
2018 138 115
2019 213 145
2020 194 105

Freedom of Information

3) How many police officers have required time off work for mental or physical health
recovery resulting from assaults against them during the years 2005, 2006, 2007,

2008, 2009, 2010, 2011, 2012, 2013, 2014, 2015, 2016, 2017, 2018, 2019, 2020

Please can | have the data in calendar years.

Please be advised that the below data has been provided by our HR department. In addition,

we do not hold data prior to August 2019.

2019 (August onwards) — 48 officers took time off due to assaults. 45 of these were assaults

while on duty, and 3 were assaults while off duty.

2020 - 74 officers took time off due to assaults. 73 of these were assaults while on duty, and
1 was assault while off duty.

08/10/2021

1324A/21



