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1. How many religious hate crimes did your force report to the Home Office where the 

victim was aged 15 or under in the following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

 

 

Performance 
Year 

Victim Age 
Total 

7 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 

2017-2018 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 3 4 

2018-2019 0 0 0 0 2 2 3 4 11 

2019-2020 1 1 1 1 2 1 2 0 9 

2020-2021 0 0 1 2 0 0 2 0 5 

Total 1 1 2 3 4 3 8 7 29 

 

 

 

 

2. Of the religious hate crimes reported in answer to Q1, how many took place on school 

property in the following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

 

We do not hold this data in a format that we are able to search.  We are only able to search 

for “Educational premises”.  This will be recorded in such a way when the offence was 

“reported” from an educational premise, so if a crime was reported at different location say 

for example a home address, then it would not come back in this search. 

 

Also an educational premise can be from nursery school, all the way through the educational 

system to University.  

 

Therefore each individual record would need to be assessed in order to retrieve this 

information, and together with the other questions listed would exceed the cost in relation to 

the Freedom of Information Act. 
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3. Of the religious hate crimes reported in answer to Q1, how many of these hate crimes 

were reported by someone who worked at the school of the victim (eg a teacher) in 

the following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

Each individual record would need to be assessed in order to retrieve this information, and 

together with the other questions listed would exceed the cost in relation to the Freedom of 

Information Act. 

 

4. How many religious hate crimes did your force report to the Home Office where the 

perceived religion of the victim was Muslim and 15 years old or under in the 

following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

Performance 
Year 

Victim Age 
Total 

11 12 13 14 15 

2017-2018 0 0 0 1 0 1 

2018-2019 0 0 2 1 3 6 

2019-2020 1 1 1 1 0 4 

2020-2021 0 0 0 2 0 2 

Total 1 1 3 5 3 13 

 

The search “Muslim” is not one of our search parameters, therefore the data in the table 

above relates to the religion “Islam” from within our systems.  

 

 

5. Of the religious hate crimes reported in answer to Q4 where the perceived religion of 

the victim was Muslim and 15 years old or under, how many took place on school 

property in the following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

We do not hold this data in a format that we are able to search.  We are only able to search 

for “Educational premises”.  This will be recorded in such a way when the offence was 

“reported” from an educational premise, so if a crime was reported at different location say 

for example a home address, then it would not come back in this search. 

 

Also an educational premise can be from nursery school, all the way through the educational 

system to University.  

 

Therefore each individual record would need to be assessed in order to retrieve this 

information, and together with the other questions listed would exceed the cost in relation to 

the Freedom of Information Act. 
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6. Of the religious hate crimes reported in answer to Q4 where the perceived religion of 

the victim was Muslim and 15 years old or under, how many of these hate crimes 

were reported by someone who worked at the school of the victim (eg a teacher) in 

the following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

Each individual record would need to be assessed in order to retrieve this information, and 

together with the other questions listed would exceed the cost in relation to the Freedom of 

Information Act. 

 

 

7. How many religious hate crimes did your force report to the Home Office where the 

perceived religion of the victim was Sikh and 15 years old or under in the following 

years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

 

Performance 
Year 

Victim Age 
Total 

7 9 14 15 

2017-2018 0 0 0 1 1 

2018-2019 0 0 1 0 1 

2019-2020 1 1 1 0 3 

Total 1 1 2 1 5 

 

 

 

 

8. Of the religious hate crimes reported in answer to Q7 where the perceived religion of 

the victim was Sikh and 15 years old or under, how many took place on school 

property in the following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

We do not hold this data in a format that we are able to search.  We are only able to search 

for “Educational premises”.  This will be recorded in such a way when the offence was 

“reported” from an educational premise, so if a crime was reported at different location say 

for example a home address, then it would not come back in this search. 

 

Also an educational premise can be from nursery school, all the way through the educational 

system to University.  
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Therefore each individual record would need to be assessed in order to retrieve this 

information, and together with the other questions listed would exceed the cost in relation to 

the Freedom of Information Act. 

 

 

9. Of the religious hate crimes reported in answer to Q4 where the perceived religion of 

the victim was Sikh and 15 years old or under, how many of these hate crimes were 

reported by someone who worked at the school of the victim (eg a teacher) in the 

following years:  

a. 2017-18 

b. 2018-19 

c. 2019-20 

 

Each individual record would need to be assessed in order to retrieve this information, and 

together with the other questions listed would exceed the cost in relation to the Freedom of 

Information Act. 

 


