

1) Can I please have your records concerning the sales of personal data from 2019 and 2020, including trading partners and money earned from transactions?

No recorded information held

2) Please can I have your records concerning the determining the price of personal data, for sales and sharing for the time period January 2019- Present.

No recorded information held

3) What is your internal procedure for selling personal data? By this, I mean guidance given to internal staff and the buyer in question, for the time period of January 2019- Present.

No recorded information held

4) What types of personal data do you sell and are there any limits placed on this? For the time period of January 2019- Present.

No recorded information held

5) How many Subject Access Requests did you receive in the period 2017-2020, broken down by year?

2017	666
2018	953
2019	1273
2020 <i>(available date range: 01/02/2020 – 27/07/2020)</i>	601
Total:	3493

6) What types of personal data did they typically receive? For example email addresses, home addresses and telephone numbers?

Exempt by virtue of Section 12 of the FOI Act. Please see covering letter for further details.

However, in order to assist, there are examples of commonly requested information on our WA162 form which is available on our website at the link below. These include crime reports, custody records, statements, interview records and body worn video/photographs.

<https://www.west-midlands.police.uk/about-us/privacy-notice/individuals-rights>

In addition, please be advised that WMP's Privacy Notice (at the link above) provides clear guidance on when and why forces will share data.