

**REQUEST**

**1. For the period 01/01/2018 to 31/12/2018 and 01/01/2019 to the present date, on a month by month basis how many stolen vehicles were involved in pursuits?**

We do not have central recording category which would identify pursuits. Therefore each incident log would need to be retrieved and the summary of the incident read to see if this mentioned a pursuit

Therefore the cost of providing you with the information is above the amount to which we are legally required to respond i.e. the cost of locating and retrieving the information exceeds the 'appropriate level' as stated in the Freedom of Information (Fees and Appropriate Limit) Regulations 2004.

**2. In the first 7 months of this year, how many stolen motor vehicles have you recorded**

See table within answer to Question 3

**3. What was the number of vehicles recorded stolen in 2015**

Theft of a Motor Vehicle	
Year	Total
2015	2707
2018	7024
2019	6057

**4. of the motor vehicles stolen so far this year (2019), how many were**

**a. Ford / b. Audi / c. Mercedes**

Please see answer within Question 6

**5. Please provide a breakdown by make/model of all stolen vehicles in 2019**

See attached spreadsheet

**6. Of the motor vehicles stolen in 2015, how many were**

**a. Ford / b. Audi / c. Mercedes**

Make - Ford - AUDI - MERCEDES	Year		
	2015	2018	2019
AUDI	204	685	635
BEDFORD	1	0	1
FORD	520	2087	1456
MERCEDES	109	346	295
MERCEDES BENZ	9	36	30
Grand Total	843	3154	2417

**7. Please provide a breakdown by make/model of all stolen vehicles for 2015**

See attached spreadsheet

**8. What methods of theft are recorded by your constabulary i.e. robbery, burglary, keys in the vehicle, security bypass/interference**

We do not record the method of theft, again as we do not have central recording category which would the method  
Therefore each incident log would need to be retrieved and the summary of the incident read to see if this mentioned the method of theft.

Therefore the cost of providing you with the information is above the amount to which we are legally required to respond i.e. the cost of locating and retrieving the information exceeds the 'appropriate level' as stated in the Freedom of Information (Fees and Appropriate Limit) Regulations 2004.

**9. Of the thefts for 2015, 2018 and 2019 what method of theft was recorded for each?**

We do not record the method of theft, again as we do not have central recording category which would the method  
Therefore each incident log would need to be retrieved and the summary of the incident read to see if this mentioned the method of theft.

Therefore the cost of providing you with the information is above the amount to which we are legally required to respond i.e. the cost of locating and retrieving the information exceeds the 'appropriate level' as stated in the Freedom of Information (Fees and Appropriate Limit) Regulations 2004.

**10. Of the vehicles stolen 2015, 2018 and 2019, please provide the recovery statistics you possess and advise how these are recorded, accessed.**

When a vehicle is recovered the Crime log is updated with a special interest marker of Recovered. Therefore we have provided data where a vehicle has a "recovered" marker on the crime log.

Total of Cars Recovered	2015	2018	2019
	150	207	189
Of the cars recovered the total of Audi / Ford / Mercedes recovered.			
AUDI	6	21	20
FORD	34	52	32
MERCEDES	11	11	8
Total	51	84	60

*\*However it is important to note we use other markers for example damaged*

**11. Do you have a dedicated SVS (stolen vehicle squad)? If so:**

We don't have a stolen vehicle squad – therefore no recorded information is held.

**12. What personnel resources did this have each year from 01/01/2015 to the present?**

Please see question 11.