

1. What is the total number of recorded burglaries and aggravated burglaries according to Section 9 and 10 of the Theft Act?

A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30-Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30-Nov-17	Grand Total
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY DWELLING	28	51	79
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	40	0	40
ATTEMPT AGGRAVATED BURGLARY DWELLING	0	1	1
ATTEMPT AGGRAVATED BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	7	0	7
ATTEMPT BURGLARY DWELLING	988	2301	3289
ATTEMPT BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	2426	0	2426
ATTEMPT DISTRACTION BURGLARY DWELLING	2	9	11
ATTEMPT DISTRACTION BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	18	0	18
BURGLARY DWELLING	4496	10691	15187
BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	10656	0	10656
DISTRACTION BURGLARY DWELLING	106	277	383
DISTRACTION BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	222	0	222
Grand Total	18989	13330	32319

2. Number of cases where a charge was brought against a suspect according to the above.

A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30-Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30-Nov-17	Grand Total
Adult Caution (Alt Offence)	1	3	4
Caution - Adult	5	15	20
Caution - Youth	5	4	9
Charge	677	821	1498
Charge / Summons (Alt Offence)	73	44	117
Community Resolution	9	10	19
Filed, no Susp, no further enq	16980	11527	28507
Further non-Police Action	1	3	4
Not Public Interest CPS	1	0	1
Not Public Interest Police	3	3	6
Postal Charge	65	69	134
Postal Charge (Alt Offence)	8	9	17
Susp ID: No Victim Support	167	131	298
Susp ID: Not in public interest	2	3	5
Susp ID: Oth Evidential Difficulty	476	466	942
Susp ID: Susp too Ill	1	0	1

Susp ID: Vict Evidential Difficulty	78	54	132
TIC	48	149	197
Youth Caution (Alt Offence)	0	1	1
(blank/ not known)	389	18	407
Grand Total	18989	13330	32319

If you have this as a percentage and can provide within the cost limitations, please provide this.

As previously advised percentages are not recorded.

3. Number of times that a car was recorded stolen during a burglary or aggravated burglary

A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

A search of offences where the property stolen is motor car.

Offences	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY	0	1	1
ATTEMPT BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	1	1
BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY	0	62	62
BURGLARY DWELLING	1006	354	1360
BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING	73	24	97
BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	1036	1036
DISTRACTION BURGLARY DWELLING	1	0	1
DISTRACTION BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	3	3
Grand Total	1080	1481	2561

As previously advised to conduct a more refined search of the summary of the crime record, would exceed the cost threshold.

4. Number of people under the age of 18 charged with the offence of burglary or aggravated burglary

A) between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Total of outcomes for question 1, where the defendant / suspect is under 18 years old when the offence was recorded.

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY DWELLING	2	0	2
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	3	3
ATTEMPT BURGLARY DWELLING	22	3	25

ATTEMPT BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING	3	5	8
ATTEMPT BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	7	7
BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY	0	9	9
BURGLARY DWELLING	132	85	217
BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING	50	10	60
BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	134	134
DISTRACTION BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL	0	2	2
GO EQUIPPED FOR BURGLARY	5	4	9
Grand Total	214	262	476

If you have this as a percentage, please provide this. (i.e: X% of individuals charged with the offence of burglary or aggravated burglary, were aged under 18)

As previously advised percentages are not recorded.

THEFT WITH MURDER

5. If you can provide this within the cost limitations I would like to know the number of cases where a murder or manslaughter took place during a burglary or aggravated burglary between 1/12/16- 30/11/17 EXCLUDING cases where the perpetrator was killed (i.e: the home owner shoots the thief)

As previously advised we have to crime the most serious offence so in these circumstances it would be the murder / manslaughter that would be crimed. These records would then need to be cross reference if this was a result of a Burglary, this would exceed the cost threshold.

CAR THEFT

6. How many cars were recorded stolen?

A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
ATTEMPT THEFT OF MOTOR VEHICLE	68	90	158
TAKE CONVEYANCE W/O CONSENT	25	28	53
TAKE MOTOR/VEH W/O OWNER CONSENT	827	864	1691
THEFT OF MOTOR VEHICLE	5704	8392	14096
Grand Total	6624	9374	15998

7. If possible within the cost limit, please identify how many keyless car thefts were recorded.

A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Where "keyless "appears in the summary notes.

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
AGG VEH TAKE DRIVE - NOT CAUSE DEATH	2	2	4
TAKE CONVEYANCE W/O CONSENT	1		1
TAKE MOTOR/VEH W/O OWNER CONSENT	4	2	6
THEFT OF MOTOR VEHICLE	82	96	178
Grand Total	89	100	189

If possible within the cost limit, please identify how many keyless car thefts were recorded which likely involved the use of sophisticated technology to unlock and start the car. We understand that if that car was not recovered you cannot definitively understand the means by which it was taken. A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17 B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

As previously advised we are unable to identify this without retrieving each summary record, this would exceed the cost threshold

8. How many of the cars recorded stolen between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17 were recovered?

As previously advised we are unable to identify without retrieving each record and cross matching with items recovered this would exceed the cost threshold.

9. The number of reports of aggravated vehicle taking, according to Section 12A of the Theft Act:

A) between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
AGG VEH TAKE DRIVE - NOT CAUSE DEATH	349	334	683
Grand Total	349	334	683

10. If possible within the cost limit, please identify how many of these relate specifically to cars.

A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17

B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16

Offences where the type of vehicle is mentioned as a car.

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
AGG VEH TAKE DRIVE - NOT CAUSE DEATH	263	265	528
Grand Total	263	265	528

STOLEN GOODS**11. Number of recorded offences of handling stolen goods as according to Section 22 of the theft act between 1/12/16- 30/11/17**

Offence	Number of Offences		
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
HANDLE GOODS-RETAIN/REMOVE/DISPOSE	4	4	8
HANDLE STOLEN GOODS (RECEIVE)	166	151	317
Grand Total	170	155	325

12. The estimated total value of items stolen in burglaries and aggravated burglaries recorded.**A) Between 1/12/16 - 30/11/17****B) Between 1/12/15 - 30/11/16**

Value where this entered in the property field. As previously advised to conduct a more refined search of the summary of the crime record, would exceed the cost threshold.

Offence			
	01-Dec-15 - 30- Nov-16	01-Dec-16 - 30- Nov-17	Grand Total
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY		£706.00	£706.00
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY DWELLING	£1,802.00		£1,802.00
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING	£1.00		£1.00
AGGRAVATED BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL		£4.00	£4.00
ATTEMPT AGGRAVATED BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY			
ATTEMPT AGGRAVATED BURGLARY DWELLING			
ATTEMPT AGGRAVATED BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING			
ATTEMPT AGGRAVATED BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL		£1.00	£1.00
ATTEMPT BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY		£8.00	£8.00
ATTEMPT BURGLARY DWELLING	£663.00	£255.00	£918.00
ATTEMPT BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING	£155.00	£4.00	£159.00
ATTEMPT BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL		£2,013.00	£2,013.00
ATTEMPT DISTRACTION BURGLARY DWELLING			
ATTEMPT DISTRACTION BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL			
BURGLARY BUSINESS AND COMMUNITY		£2,378,213.89	£2,378,213.89
BURGLARY DWELLING	£14,960,626.79	£5,581,156.08	£20,541,782.87
BURGLARY OTHER BUILDING	£1,345,274.17	£365,999.20	£1,711,273.37
BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL		£19,966,934.72	£19,966,934.72
DISTRACTION BURGLARY DWELLING	£2,417.00	£321.99	£2,738.99
DISTRACTION BURGLARY RESIDENTIAL		£2,271.00	£2,271.00
GO EQUIPPED FOR BURGLARY	£3.00		£3.00
Grand Total	£16,310,941.96	£28,297,887.88	£44,608,829.84

Under the Freedom of Information Act we are obliged to provide you with all of the information we have recorded that falls within the scope of your request, regardless of the accuracy of those data. We are aware of inaccuracies with the data within Question 12 , for example one record shows the property value stolen was £5,400,000.00 for a vehicle.

However, despite these apparent inaccuracies, we are supplying these data so as to comply with the Act.

Please note in order to explain the inaccuracies would involve a manual search of each record , this cost of this search is above the amount to which we are legally required to respond, i.e. the cost of locating and retrieving the information would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of information Act 2000. For West Midlands Police, the appropriate limit is set at £450, as prescribed by the Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulations 2004, S.I. 3244.