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1, How many driving offences have been recorded by the police in your force area in 2018/2019, 

2017/2018, 2016/2017? 

 

The below are the only figure we can provide and have been retrieved from Pentip.  

2018/2019 - 73395 

2017/2018 - 43101 

2016/2017 - 63812 

 

2, How many speeding driving offences have been recorded by the police in your force area in 

2018/2019, 2017/2018, 2016/2017? 

 

2018/2019 - 62707 

2017/2018 - 34776 

2016/2017 - 53884 

 

3. How many driving without insurance offences have been recorded by the police in your force 

area in 2018/2019, 2017/2018, 2016/2017? 

 

2018/2019 - 1968 

2017/2018 - 2289 

2016/2017 - 2809 

 

4. How many driving under the influence of drink or drugs offences have been recorded by the 

police in your force area in 

2018/2019? 

2017/2018? 

2016/2017? 

 

Please see: https://foi.west-midlands.police.uk/drink-drug-driving-3475_18/  

 

https://foi.west-midlands.police.uk/drink-drug-driving-13825-19/  

 

5, How many driving offences have been recorded by the police in your force area, committed by 

foreign nationals… (Breakdown of country if possible)  

2018/2019? 

2017/2018? 

2016/2017? 

 

This information is not held, nationality is not recorded on Pentip 

 

 

6, How many speeding driving offences have been recorded by the police in your force area, 

committed by foreign nationals in 

2018/2019? 

2017/2018? 

2016/2017? 

 

Please see above 

 

7. How many driving without insurance offences have been recorded by the police in your force 

area, committed by foreign nationals in  

 

https://foi.west-midlands.police.uk/drink-drug-driving-3475_18/
https://foi.west-midlands.police.uk/drink-drug-driving-13825-19/
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2018/2019? 

2017/2018? 

2016/2017? 

 

Please see above 

 

8. How many driving under the influence of drink or drugs offences have been recorded by the 

police in your force area, committed by foreign nationals in 

 

2018/2019? 

2017/2018? 

2016/2017? 

 

Please see above 

 

 


