West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

1. How many police officers are currently trained to use of a Taser?

2,381

2. Which departments/units (i.e. Roads Policing/Neighbourhood Policing) contain
officers who carry Tasers?

Airport Policing Unit

Force Response

Neighbourhood Policing Unit
Central Motorway Policing Group
Operational Support Unit

Force Support Unit

Learning & Development
Firearms

Counter Terrorism Unit

3. Do you intend to increase the number of Taser trained officers over the next 12
months?

No recorded information held

4. 1f so, by how many.

No recorded information held

5. Are Tasers issued to any officer who wishes to undergo the training required?

No, this is role dependent
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