

**Below is a tally of transgender identity hate crimes logged by the various police forces in England and Wales during the 2017/18 financial year.**

**In relation to the numbers that relate to your force could you state:**

**1. How many were physical assaults**

5 (these include the offences of 'assault occasion ABH' and 'common assault')

**2. How many were threats or abuse that was posted online?**

1

**3. For the first five incidents of threats or abuse posted online in 2017/18 please state (i) the name of the website or social media platform**

Twitter

**(ii) the exact words that were used that constituted the offence.**

On further examination of this case, the exact words used are not recorded in the summary field, investigation log or record. Therefore, under FOI this information is not held.