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Request reference: 3330/13 
 
Q1.    I am looking for the total amount of collisions reported in your force area 
over the period 1st January 2012 to 31st December 2012. These would include 
all fatal, serious , minor injury and damage only collisions if you record those 
details. Accuracy over exact numbers is not necessary as I am looking for a 
good idea how your force deals with crashes and the volume it creates for you. 
If you do not record detail such as damage only collisions then I accept this is 
a force decision. 
 

COUNT OF WEST MIDLANDS INJURY ROAD TRAFFIC COLLISIONS BY 
SEVERITY 

(BETWEEN 01 JANUARY 2012 AND 31 DECEMBER 2012) 

FATAL SERIOUS SLIGHT DAMAGE ONLY 

52 794 3,823 9,286 

 
 
Q2.    Do you have a police officer attend every reported collision or is there 
some sort of force matrix which essentially says "we will not deal with this 
kind of crash" 
 
West Midlands Road Traffic Collision Policy – Ops/07 states: 
 

“Initial Action. When an officer attends the scene of a reportable 
collision, the officer will ensure that the recording criteria still apply.  
 
14.2 Non-Recordable. In the event of a non-injury collision, where 
the Road Traffic Act has been complied with and where a 
prosecution is unlikely to result, then the matter should be 
concluded by ensuring that full details are exchanged between 
parties. Sufficient information is then to be entered on any OASIS 
Command and Control incident log and the parties advised that no 
further police involvement will take place. The parties will be 
supplied with the OASIS log number.” 

 
Please also see attached a copy of the Collision Investigation Units – Attendance 
Criteria and Deployment Principles which I feel will also suit your needs. 
 

POLICE OFFICER ATTENDED THE SCENE AND OBTAINED THE DETAILS FOR 
AN INJURY ACCIDENT REPORT 

(BETWEEN 01 JANUARY 2012 AND 31 DECEMBER 2012) 

Attended 3744 

Did not attend 894 

Not stated 1 
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Q3.    I appreciate that obtaining NFA details may require a manual search and 
this would exceed the hours allowed for a search before charges and could 
lead to refusal. If you can indicate how many crashes were reported to your 
force but not dealt with because of management/force decisions that would 
cover it. If however you do not record this detail and it would again mean 
searching each crash record then please omit question 3. 
 
The only way to identify the requested information would be to undertake a manual 
search of each individual case. Therefore, such a search would exceed the 
appropriate limit. This means that the cost of compliance with your request is above 
the amount to which we are legally required to respond, i.e. the cost of locating and 
retrieving the information would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 
of the Freedom of information Act 2000. For West Midlands Police, the appropriate 
limit is set at £450, as prescribed by the Freedom of Information and Data Protection 
(Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulations 2004, S.I. 3244. In accordance with the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a refusal notice. 
 
 


